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Subject: RE: GG Ambulance Agreement Amendment

From: Bill Weston <billw@careambulance.net>

Date: 8/9/2019, 5:07 PM

To: "'Paul WhiƩaker'" <pwhiƩaker@ci.garden‐grove.ca.us>

Chief, all three are signed by our CEO and CFO.  Do you want them delivered today or is Monday
OK?

From: Paul Whittaker [mailto:pwhittaker@ci.garden-grove.ca.us]
Sent: Friday, August 09, 2019 4:44 PM
To: Bill Weston
Subject: Re: GG Ambulance Agreement Amendment

Bill,
We are good with the revisions. Please have three copies signed. 
Thanks 

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 8, 2019, at 9:14 AM, Bill Weston <billw@careambulance.net> wrote:

Chief, here is the language change made by our attorney. It reflects how we operate
today and is consistent with the answers provided at the bidders conference re: ALS
billing.

From: Brian Richmond [mailto:brian.richmond@falck.com]
Sent: Wednesday, August 07, 2019 2:12 PM
To: Bill Weston; Troy Hagen; Michael.Gorman
Cc: Rob Viera; Ben Baker
Subject: RE: GG Ambulance Agreement Amendment

Excellent.  The amendment isn’t parƟcularly clear on that, I think it actually reads that we pay them no
maƩer what. 
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I have made some edits in the aƩachment to reflect the pass through.  Please review my edits.

Brian M. Richmond
Chief Legal Counsel
______________________________________

Falck USA, Inc.
6405 218th Street SW, Suite 201
Mountlake Terrace, WA 98043

  
brian.richmond@falck.com

Compliance Hotline:  www.falckalert.com

From: Bill Weston <billw@careambulance.net>
Sent: Wednesday, August 07, 2019 11:59 AM
To: Brian Richmond <brian.richmond@falck.com>; troyh@careambulance.net; Michael Gorman
<Michael.Gorman@falck.com>
Cc: Robert Viera <rob.viera@falck.com>; Ben Baker <benb@careambulance.net>
Subject: RE: GG Ambulance Agreement Amendment

Hi Brian – Thank you for the review.  Our ALS is a straight pass thru.  We only pay the
City of GG what we collect above the BLS, less our billing service fee. 

The medical supply reimbursement is paid on every transport, regardless of collections
and is part of the County ambulance rate ordinance.  We do it in some fashion for every
city contract.

From: Brian Richmond [mailto:brian.richmond@falck.com]
Sent: Wednesday, August 07, 2019 11:10 AM
To: Bill Weston; Troy Hagen; Michael.Gorman
Cc: Rob Viera; Ben Baker
Subject: RE: GG Ambulance Agreement Amendment

No legal issues, but are we OK with the rates?

It looks like we pay the ALS fee whether we collect or not. 

Brian M. Richmond
Chief Legal Counsel
______________________________________

Falck USA, Inc.
6405 218th Street SW, Suite 201
Mountlake Terrace, WA 98043

RE:	GG	Ambulance	Agreement	Amendment 	

2	of	5 2/13/2020,	3:04	PM



brian.richmond@falck.com

Compliance Hotline:  www.falckalert.com

From: Bill Weston <billw@careambulance.net>
Sent: Monday, August 05, 2019 2:51 PM
To: troyh@careambulance.net; Brian Richmond <brian.richmond@falck.com>; Michael Gorman
<Michael.Gorman@falck.com>
Cc: Robert Viera <rob.viera@falck.com>; Ben Baker <benb@careambulance.net>
Subject: FW: GG Ambulance Agreement Amendment

Hello Brain, Troy and Mike – As you may know, the GG Fire Department is scheduled to
dissolve and be replaced with the Orange County Fire Authority.  The City of GG will
continue to contract for ambulance services with the City’s EOC Manager overseeing
the contract. 

Currently, Care Ambulance contracts with the City of GG and has approx. 8 years left
on our agreement.  This is an amendment to transfer some of the operational pieces,
like dispatch, to OCFA and ultimately back to Care.  This also sets a new medical
supply reimbursement rate at the old County standard of $18.15 per transport, versus
the almost $30 per transport desired by GG. 

The $18.15 supply reimbursement rate was set by the County EMS Agency over 20
years ago and included a significant increase to our BLS base rate to net the $18.15 per
transport reimbursement.

Can you please take a look and determine if we need any changes?

Thanks.

From: Paul Whittaker [mailto:pwhittaker@ggcity.org]
Sent: Monday, August 05, 2019 9:33 AM
To: Bill Weston
Cc: pwhittaker
Subject: GG Ambulance Agreement Amendment

Bill,
Attached is an amendment to the ambulance agreement. Please take a look and have
three copies signed and returned to me as soon as possible.
Thanks

Paul Whittaker 
Admin Div Chief/Fire Marshal
Garden Grove Fire Department 
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W. 714-741-5614

pwhittaker@ggcity.org

CONFIDENTIALITY STATEMENT: The informaƟon in this e‐mail is confidenƟal and may be legally
privileged. It is intended for the use only of the addressee. If you have received this communicaƟon in
error, be advised that any disseminaƟon of the email or its aƩachments is strictly forbidden. If you are
not the intended recipient of the email, please erase all copies of the message and its aƩachments and
noƟfy us immediately. SECURITY WARNING: Please note that this e‐mail has been created in the
knowledge that Internet email is not a 100% secure communicaƟons medium. We advise that you
understand and observe this lack of security when e‐mailing us. Although we have taken steps to ensure
that this e‐mail and aƩachments are free from any virus, we recommend that the recipient should
ensure local scanning of the content and any aƩachment.

CAUTION: This email is originated from outside of the organizaƟon. Do not click on links or open any aƩachments
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

“CONFIDENTIALITY STATEMENT AND PERSONAL DATA STATEMENT: The
information in this e-mail and any attachments is confidential. It is intended for use only by the
addressee. If you have received this e-mail in error, you must not forward this e-mail or any
attachment or disclose the content to any other person. If you are not the intended recipient of the
e-mail, please erase all copies of the e-mail and its attachments and notify the sender
immediately. This e-mail may contain personal data. Please ensure to observe applicable data
protection legislation when processing the personal data included in the e-mail and any
attachments, including appropriate data minimisation and deletion. SECURITY STATEMENT:
Please note that e-mail communication is not 100% secure. Therefore, this e-mail may not be
fully secure, and you are also advised to take this into account when e-mailing us. Although we
have taken steps to ensure that this e-mail and attachments are free from any virus, we
recommend that the recipient takes measures to ensure local scanning of the content and any
attachments.”
CONFIDENTIALITY STATEMENT: The informaƟon in this e‐mail is confidenƟal and may be legally
privileged. It is intended for the use only of the addressee. If you have received this communicaƟon in
error, be advised that any disseminaƟon of the email or its aƩachments is strictly forbidden. If you are
not the intended recipient of the email, please erase all copies of the message and its aƩachments and
noƟfy us immediately. SECURITY WARNING: Please note that this e‐mail has been created in the
knowledge that Internet email is not a 100% secure communicaƟons medium. We advise that you
understand and observe this lack of security when e‐mailing us. Although we have taken steps to ensure
that this e‐mail and aƩachments are free from any virus, we recommend that the recipient should
ensure local scanning of the content and any aƩachment.

CAUTION: This email is originated from outside of the organizaƟon. Do not click on links or open any aƩachments
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

CONFIDENTIALITY STATEMENT: The information in this e-mail is confidential and may be
legally privileged. It is intended for the use only of the addressee. If you have received this
communication in error, be advised that any dissemination of the email or its attachments is
strictly forbidden. If you are not the intended recipient of the email, please erase all copies of the
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message and its attachments and notify us immediately. SECURITY WARNING: Please note
that this e-mail has been created in the knowledge that Internet email is not a 100% secure
communications medium. We advise that you understand and observe this lack of security when
e-mailing us. Although we have taken steps to ensure that this e-mail and attachments are free
from any virus, we recommend that the recipient should ensure local scanning of the content and
any attachment.

<GG Ambulance Agreement Second Amendment 2019 (5).docx>

CONFIDENTIALITY STATEMENT: The informaƟon in this e‐mail is confidenƟal and may be legally

privileged. It is intended for the use only of the addressee. If you have received this communicaƟon in

error, be advised that any disseminaƟon of the email or its aƩachments is strictly forbidden. If you are

not the intended recipient of the email, please erase all copies of the message and its aƩachments

and noƟfy us immediately. SECURITY WARNING: Please note that this e‐mail has been created in the

knowledge that Internet email is not a 100% secure communicaƟons medium. We advise that you

understand and observe this lack of security when e‐mailing us. Although we have taken steps to

ensure that this e‐mail and aƩachments are free from any virus, we recommend that the recipient

should ensure local scanning of the content and any aƩachment.

Attachments:
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