G CITY OF GARDEN GROVE

GARDEN GROVE FIRE DEPARTMENT

Tel: (714) 741-5600
Fax: (714) 741-5640

1/17/2017
Greg Parrone

RE: Records Search for 12752, 12772, 12782 12882 Monarch St., Garden
Grove CA

Dear Greg Parrone:

Enclosed are the records found concerning the history of the above-
mentioned site(s), especially as it pertains to fire code violation history,
permits, the use, storage, or disposal of hazardous substances, and the
installation or removal of underground flammable or combustible liquid

storage tanks.

The City of Garden Grove Fire Department has utilized its best efforts to
locate the records requested. However, the City makes no representation
as to the accuracy of the records or that all records requested were retained
or located. The City does not provide records on spills, leaks or clean-up, as
that information is provided through the County of Orange Health Dept.

Sincerely,

Thanh Nguyen
Fire Captain/Senior Fire Protection Specialist

11301 Acacia Parkway - P.O.Box 3070 - Garden Grove, CA 92842
www.ci.garden-grove.ca.us



Violation List for
VIRTU USA
12752 MIONARCH St

Date Issued Date Cleared Code i

12/08/2016
12/08/2016
12/08/2016
12/08/2016
12/08/2016
12/08/2016
12/08/2016
12/08/2016
06/16/2014
06/16/2014
06/16/2014
06/16/2014
06/16/2014
06/16/2014
06/16/2014
06/16/2014

00/00/00
00/00/00
00/00/00
00/00/00
00/00/00
00/00/00
00/00/00
00/00/00
08/18/2014
08/18/2014
08/18/2014
08/18/2014
08/18/2014
08/25/2014
08/18/2014
08/18/2014

CFC 703.1.3
CFC 1003.6
CFC 1008.1.1
CFC 1008.1.¢
CFC 605.3
Title 19 Sec.
HSC 25504t
CFC 605.6
CFC 1011.2
CFC 605.3
CFC 105.3.5
CFC 1008.1.1
CFC 1028.3
HSC 25505(¢
CFC 605.6
Title 19, Sec.

Violation Description

Replace missing ceiling tiles in downstairs office and server room
Remove wire or provide proper coverage to prevent a trip hazard (br
Remove locks, chains, bolts or bars from exit door.

Provide approved panic hardware

Keep 30" clear in front of elec. panel

Hang extinguisher(s) 3.5-5' from floor

Emergency Response Plan is inadequate.

Discontinue use of extension cords.

Provide illuminated exit sign(s).

Keep 30" clear in front of elec. panel

POST BUSINESS LICENSE. 0029-JACOB SHULTS.

Remove locks, chains, bolts or bars from exit door.

Remove exit obstruction

Failure to submit a Business Emergency Plan.

Discontinue use of extension cords.

5 yr. certification on sprinkler / standpipe system.




Violation List for
V-FACTORY
12772 MONARCH St

Date Issued Date Cleared Code Violation Description

10/28/2004 11/11/2004 CFC 1212.4 Provide illuminated exit sign(s).
10/28/2004 11/11/2004 CFC 1001.5. Service and tag Fire Extinguishers.
10/28/2004 11/11/2004 Title 19 Sec. Hang extinguisher(s) 3.5'-5' from floor

10/12/2006 06/07/2007 Title 19, Sec. 5 yr. certification on sprinkler / standpipe system.




Violation List for
RIVERA BEVERAGES LLC
12782 MONARCH St

Date Issued Date Cleared Code i

Violation Description

08/12/2014 11/05/2014 HSC 25505(z Failure to submit a Business Emergency Plan.

08/12/2014 11/05/2014 CFC 605.6 Discontinue use of extension cords.

01/19/2011 02/09/2011 Title 19 Sec. Hang extinguisher(s) 3.5'-5' from floor

01/19/2011 02/09/2011 CFC 901.6 Service and tag Fire Extinguishers.

01/19/2011 02/09/2011 CFC 10086.1 Provide and maintain approved emergency lighting.

01/09/2011 02/09/2011 FLAMMABLE LIGUDS CABINETS REQUIRED FOR FLAVORING-/
01/09/2011 02/09/2011 LABEL DOOR WHERE RISER IS LOCATED.

01/09/2011 02/09/2011 REPAIR HOLE IN MIXING ROOM. ADJUST DOOR.

01/09/2011 02/09/2011 RELOCATE EXIT SIGN AND REMOVE ARROW TO SHOW DIREC
01/09/2011 02/09/2011 CFC 3003.5.. Secure compressed gas cylinders.

01/09/2011 02/09/2011 CFC 2701.5 Complete Haz Mat Disclosure packet

01/09/2011 02/09/2011 CFC 605.6 Discontinue use of extension cords.




0. PERMIT# :000765
1. INSPECTION# : 005066

2. PERMIT LOC : 12822 MONARCH ST

3. BUSINESS NAME: CANNON EQUIPMENT WEST INC 9. BUS LICENSE:137059
4. PHONE: 373-5800 10. OCC CLASS :F1

5. BILL-TO-NAME : CANNON EQUIPMENT WEST INC ~ 11.ISSUE DATE :01-04-01
6. BILL-TO-ADDR : 12822 MONARCH ST 12, EXPIRATION :12-31-01

7. BILL-TO-CSZ : GARDEN GROVE CA 92841 13. TOTAL FEES :325.00

8. REMARKS 14. INSPECTOR :1705

COLLINS, PATRICK S

NO. CODE DESCRIPTION / CONDITION FEE

1 761021 DUST PRODUCING IN F-1 55.00
OPERATION OF A (F1) WOODWORKING SHOP PRODUCTING DUSTS

SHALL COMPLY WITH ALL APPLICABLE STATE AND LOCAL CODES.

2 821021 LIQUEFIED PETROLEUM GASES . 55.00
STORAGE, HANDLING AND/OR TRANSPORTATION OF MORE THAN 125
GALLONS OF LIQUID PETROLEUM GAS IN A CONTAINER OR TANK SHALL

COMPLY WITH ALL APPLICABLE STATE AND LOCAL CODES.
. PERMIT# :010633
1. INSPECTION# : 014995

2. PERMIT LOC : 12822 MONARCH ST

3. BUSINESS NAME: CANNON EQUIPMENT WEST INC 9. BUS LICENSE:137059




4. PHONE: 373-5800 10. OCC CLASS :F1

5. BILL-TO-NAME : CANNON EQUIPMENT WEST INC 11, ISSUE DATE :02-11-02
6. BILL-TO-ADDR : 12822 MONARCH ST 12. EXPIRATION :12-31-02

7. BILL-TO-CSZ : GARDEN GROVE CA 92841 13. TOTAL FEES :365.00

8. REMARKS 14. INSPECTOR :2512

WAIDELICH, SUSAN C

NO. CODE DESCRIPTION / CONDITION FEE

1 761021 DUST PRODUCING IN F-1 60.00
OPERATION OF A (F1) WOODWORKING SHOP PRODUCTING DUSTS

SHALL COMPLY WITH ALL APPLICABLE STATE AND LOCAL CODES.

2 821021 LIQUEFIED PETROLEUM GASES 60.00
STORAGE, HANDLING AND/OR TRANSPORTATION OF MORE THAN 125
GALLONS OF LIQUID PETROLEUM GAS IN A CONTAINER OR TANK SHALL
COMPLY WITH ALL APPLICABLE STATE AND LOCAL CODES.

0. PERMIT# : 020835

1. INSPECTION# : 024944

2. PERMIT LOC : 12822 MONARCH ST

3. BUSINESS NAME: CANNON EQUIPMENT WEST INC 9. BUS LICENSE:137059
4. PHONE: 373-5800 10. OCC CLASS :H7

5. BILL-TO-NAME : CANNON EQUIPMENT WEST INC ~ 11.ISSUE DATE :12-18-02
6. BILL-TO-ADDR : 12822 MONARCH ST 12. EXPIRATION :12-31-03

7. BILL-TO-CSZ : GARDEN GROVE CA 92841 13. TOTAL FEES :415.00

8. REMARKS : 14. INSPECTOR :2512

WAIDELICH, SUSAN C




NO. CODE DESCRIPTION / CONDITION FEE

1 801031 HAZARDOUS MATERIALS 00.00
USE, HANDLING OR STORAGE OF HAZARDOUS MATERIALS SHALL COMPLY

WITH ALL APPLICABLE STATE AND LOCAL CODES.

2 761022 DUST PRODUCING NON B-2 110.00
TO CONDUCT A DUST PRODUCING OPERATION. DUST COLLECTION
SYSTEM SHALL BE MAINTAINED. SHALL COMPLY WITH STATE AND
LOCAL CODES.

.PERMIT# :10584

1. INSPECTION# : 014995

2. PERMIT LOC : 12822 MONARCH ST

3. BUSINESS NAME: CANNON EQUIPMENT WEST INC 9. BUS LICENSE:137059
4. PHONE: 373-5800 10. OCC CLASS :F1

5. BILL-TO-NAME : CANNON EQUIPMENT WEST INC ~ 11. ISSUE DATE :12-31-01
6. BILL-TO-ADDR : 12822 MONARCH ST 12. EXPIRATION :

7. BILL-TO-CSZ : GARDEN GROVE CA 92841 13. TOTAL FEES :325.00

8. REMARKS 14. INSPECTOR :1705

COLLINS, PATRICK S

NO. CODE DESCRIPTION / CONDITION FEE

1 761021 DUST PRODUCING IN F-1 55.00
OPERATION OF A (F1) WOODWORKING SHOP PRODUCTING DUSTS

SHALL COMPLY WITH ALL APPLICABLE STATE AND LOCAL CODES.

2 821021 LIQUEFIED PETROLEUM GASES 55.00




STORAGE, HANDLING AND/OR TRANSPORTATION OF MORE THAN 125
GALLONS OF LIQUID PETROLEUM GAS IN A CONTAINER OR TANK SHALL
COMPLY WITH ALL APPLICABLE STATE AND LOCAL CODES.

0. PERMIT# :980713

1. INSPECTION# : 985171

2. PERMIT LOC : 12822 MONARCH ST

3. BUSINESS NAME: CANNON EQUIPMENT WEST INC 9. BUS LICENSE:137059
4. PHONE: 373-5800 10. OCC CLASS :F1

5. BILL-TO-NAME : CANNON EQUIPMENT WEST INC ~ 11. ISSUE DATE :01-07-99
6. BILL-TO-ADDR : 12822 MONARCH ST 12. EXPIRATION :12-31-99

7. BILL-TO-CSZ : GARDEN GROVE CA 92841 13. TOTAL FEES :325.00

8. REMARKS 14. INSPECTOR :5190

LUKAS JR, EDWARD F

NO. CODE DESCRIPTION / CONDITION FEE

1 761021 DUST PRODUCING IN F-1 55.00
OPERATION OF A (F1) WOODWORKING SHOP PRODUCTING DUSTS

SHALL COMPLY WITH ALL APPLICABLE STATE AND LOCAL CODES.

2 821021 LIQUEFED PETROLEUM GASES 55.00
STORAGE, HANDLING AND/OR TRANSPORTATION OF MORE THAN 125
GALLONS OF LIQUID PETROLEUM GAS IN A CONTAINER OR TANK SHALL
COMPLY WITH ALL APPLICABLE STATE AND LOCAL CODES.

0. PERMIT# :990780

1. INSPECTION# : 995115

2. PERMIT LOC :12822 MONARCH ST




3. BUSINESS NAME: CANNON EQUIPMENT WEST INC 9. BUS LICENSE:137059
4. PHONE: 373-5800 10. OCC CLASS :F1

5. BILL-TO-NAME : CANNON EQUIPMENT WEST INC ~ 11. ISSUE DATE :01-25-00
6. BILL-TO-ADDR : 12822 MONARCH ST 12. EXPIRATION :12-31-00

7. BILL-TO-CSZ : GARDEN GROVE CA 92841 13. TOTAL FEES :325.00

8. REMARKS 14. INSPECTOR :5190

LUKAS JR, EDWARD F

NO. CODE DESCRIPTION / CONDITION FEE

1 761021 DUST PRODUCING IN F-1 55.00
OPERATION OF A (F1) WOODWORKING SHOP PRODUCTING DUSTS

SHALL COMPLY WITH ALL APPLICABLE STATE AND LOCAL CODES.

2 821021 LIQUEFIED PETROLEUM GASES 55.00
STORAGE, HANDLING AND/OR TRANSPORTATION OF MORE THAN 125
GALLONS OF LIQUID PETROLEUM GAS IN A CONTAINER OR TANK SHALL

COMPLY WITH ALL APPLICABLE STATE AND LOCAL CODES.




o | T Submited
RDEN GROVE FIRE' (742 i

11301 Acacia Parkway, P. O. -
Garden Grove, CA 92842 (71 7! eeds thg(lgg%enea

map &
FINAL NOTICE
AND ORDER OF THE FIRE CHIEF
” Date @%ﬁ

Address.of violation(s): {7 '7 SL Mot dy . Insp. No 3992
Occupant or DBA: _Viesw {565
Business-Owner Informagion: Building Owner Information:
Owner: %ﬁq lron / Owner:
Address: ;"2 742 ﬂ'{lamﬁcﬁdw% Address:
City: GranEr) GasJb City:
Phone: 214 SHG 71634 Zip: ‘}’2/3‘”{[ Phone: Zip:

A fire safety inspection at the above-named occupancy revealed violation(s) of the California
Fire Code. You wer provl/?ied written notification of the violation(s) and a reinspection was

scheduled for __ € /4

Upon reinspection, thé following v:olatlon(s) was/were found to be uncorrected:
Hse ol €98 Sep, 2SHPY | 2$S00 ~25S20

Faltvne T Sudm T Ny, BO

Pursuant to Section 110.4 of the 2013 California Fire Code as adopted by Section 18.04.010
of the Garden Grove Municipal Code, you are hereby ordered to make all corrections as

hsted

A FINAL reinspection will be made on g/ % /L/ , 20 / i Failure to comply with

all items of this order listed above conétltute;/a crlmmal offense and may subject the
violator to criminal prosecution, administrative fines in an amount up to $1,000 per violation

and/or other enforcement actions as available. Tf o
wob Shulks (29

Inspector

Condition upon Final i‘einspec’cion:

Date:

Inspector Signature:

[1 Administrative Citation issued on
F5-4309.1 (12/13)




By Peoperty Manoger (22f762-4360

%ARDEN GR@VE FIRE DEPARTMENT File# 5992
Life Safety & Hazardous Materials Disclosure Program Fire District 2414
11301 Acacia Parkway, Garden Grove, CA 92842 Inspector FPB  Shift N
‘Bus 714-741-5600  Fax 714-741-5640 Nextlnsp 7 /2014
OccupantorpBa VACANT [[TRT(F [ASA £ile w047 Business Te[7/&/>~§ HE-743Y
Address 12752 MONARCH St P/h)m 74 71 Oz)ic? a‘jw Suite Zip 92841
Business Owner /(*)N 4 ‘prN ‘ Tel (ﬁ?%/ )ngs‘ 660(@
nergency Contact DO‘\JOVA\\) /RIB\N Tel(?/% Wj" - 6'&0 L;
Group S2 Load Sprinklers F/P/N F 5'yr. Cert. 71 2009 Haz Mat/,f%{!
Permits %@0 662 -\~ Aaim Qozmmn@

inspection at the above location/occupany revealed the following violations(s) :

JEMBLY OCCUPANCIES

Post maximum occupancy load sign (CFC 1004.3)
Remove combustible decorative material (CFC 807.1.2)
Remove storage under 'stairway (CFC 315.3.2)

NS
Provide address visible from the street (CFC 505.1)

Provide hazardous materials warning signs (CFC 2703.5)
rs

drovide/maintain approved panic hardware (C Fé 1008.1.10) -
Remove locks, chains,bolts or bars from eX|t door (CFC 1008.1.9)

West Ext Deor

Remove exit obstruction (CFC 1003.6
JoaperSign it
Provrde/mamtam lluminated exit sign(s) (CFC 101 1) '

JESS Front Dpor

Provide outside Knox Box (CFC 508.1)
Remove obstructions to fire appara’rus access (CFC 503.4)

: PROTECTION EQUIPMENT AND SYSTE
ngushens % th}vé QﬂdS
Drovrde _ 2A10BC __40BC __K (CFC 906.1)

Service and tag extinguisher(s) (CFC 901.6)

extmgw ers

{ang extinguisher(s) 3.5'-5' from floor (CFC 906.9)
Slean filters, ducts , hood above cooking surface (CFC 904.1)

Service auto-extinguishing system semi-annually (CFC 904.11.6.2) -

[

5 yr certification on rinkler/standpipe system (Title 19, Sect. 904)

CELLANEOUS
_ower storage

Secure oompressed gas cylinders (CFC 5303.5.3)

:’ost Business License I:IFrre Department permit (CFC 105.3.5) 564’

NO VlOLATlONS

JITIONAL VIOLATIONS AND/OR NOTES #72 A},gm e S

18" below sprinklers or l:l 2" from ceiling (CFC 315.3.1) I:I Failure to submit annual certification

23 &',E&_,

- G35~ 2346 Qﬁi@; Bouﬁ\a
ELECTRICAL SAFETY PRE-CAUTIONS S\% CGTP)W)
Drscontrnug)use Efégtgnsronljo%rds (CFC 605.5) @

@/Keep 30" clear for access in front of electrical panel
(CFC 805.3)

D’Provide/replace electrical I:]Cover I___:_l SockeD Power Strip
(CFC 605.1)

HAZ-MAT SAFETY PRE-CAUTIONS

Provide approved cabinet if more than 10 gal.
[ ] fammable liquids (CFG 5704.3.4.4)

D Provide approved safety container(s) for flammable
liquids (CFC 5704.3. 1)

. HAZARDOUS MATER!ALS DISCLOSURE

(HsC CHAPTER 6.95 Section 25404, 25500 = 25520)
Failure to implement and/or eleotromcally submit a HMBP

" www.esubmit.ocgov.com Cha e ere;j
| I~ Caddree
:l:l Chemical inventory is mcomplete and/or requires updatrng

The Emergency Response Plan is inadequate and/or
does not adequately address Notification, Mitigation,
. Evacuation andfor Employee Training

[:I Site Map is incomplete or insufficient

Failure to report a change in busmess or chemical
| inventory within 30 days of the following : . \

D
l:l100% or more increase in the quantity of a disclosed material '

P

: [:l Addition of a previously undisclosed materlal '

Change of busmess name and owner

D Falure to report a release or threatened release :

4604 ey

DMINORVIOLATION {59 M “E ]
[ ] CLASS Il VIOLATION i
D'cr_/iss | VIOLATION ‘

DNO VIOLATIONS

/}) Tt n«w-}m;’)

S Crandlticrs Flnee 4ulohas

,Lbr—mzf’r ALD S?m/?}’)/r’/@f’fr Lerore D

on fan

Hng_sn_Seconc! ,ﬁéﬁf‘ s,

%"mr}‘f %\m S‘H\u W)

1ess representative sigrature

Date
lnspector Name/ ID # @Q QQ )auCO b §hv-H/‘7 Date
1 = s #7 I///J 7 /L/ | e T TR B S D N 1 I

|l@ /lll 1




GARDEN GROVE FIRE DEPARTMENT

11301 Acacia Parkway, P."O. Box 3070
Garden Grove, CA 92842 (714) 741-5600

FINAL NOTICE

AND ORDER OF THE FIRE CHIEF ) ‘
pate G /il /14
Address of violation(s): 127¢ 2% Monewch . Insp. No  £540Q

Occupant or DBA: R ivefew  bBeVeyages LEC

Business Owner Information: Building Owner Information:
Owner: R (yiorit BEUELACES Li-¢  owner: ,»"fl
Address: 12 76L MMonewch 8T Address: ”

City: Goyhzny  Gyoy= City: el

Phone: (7(U) 69S ~SI69 zip: 92%4|  Phone: / Zip:

A fire safety inspection at the above-named occupancy revealed violation(s) of the California
Fire Code. You were provided written notification of the wolatxon(s) and a reinspection was

scheduled for ?/az,/i'-{ 4 ~i/ll//‘// > L FOLLeW up g ~J//c{ 5/
Upon remspectmn, the followmg violation(s) was/were found to be uncorrected:
— Hé¢  Ch, €8S Sec, 25404, 25500~ 2552 D)
Fllere to Sobmit HMBP
DGcam ingt e WSE OF ExtEnfiion Cot & CEC - GoS ¢
- Ponides A 4771 Asis pAce [igian. Acch@ss  TNS Bm«_.onna/

Pursuant to Section 110.4 of the 2013 California Fire Code as adopted by Section 18.04.010
of the Garden Grove Municipal Code, you are hereby ordered to make all corrections as

listed.

A FINAL reinspection will be made on (7//5—'1 , 201", Failure to comply with
all items of this order listed above constitutes a cnmmal offense and may subject the
violator to criminal prosecution, administrative fines in an amount up to $1,000 per violation
and/or other enforcement actions as available.

2«"3’4’7 NeEoEF—

Inspector
Condition upon Final reinspection:
Teny
U
Ccmﬂ/&,ﬂ\‘
Inspector Signature: ne Date: ////{//4/
/ I

[]  Administrative Citation i(;/s/ued on
F5-4309.1 (12/13)




GARDEN GROVE FIRE DEPARTMENT File# 6540
Life Safety & Hazardous Materials Disclosure Program Fire District 2414
11301 Acacia Parkway, Garden Grove, CA 92842 Inspector FPB DA Shift N
Bus 714-741-5600 Fax 714-741-5640 Nextlnsp 2 /2014
Occupant or DBA RIVERA BEVERAGES LLC Business Tel 714 895-5169
Address 12782 MONARCH St Suite Zip 92841
Business Owner KEVIN-GLABK (1, L\:c,,c/\U Ouaz O w@l (50 80 3 714 8955169
Emergency Contact ”\” i \r\i (@) /\f\ \\ \\\(J AAN ji 2 Tel —H d-6le -522(
Group 51 Load Sprinklers F/P/N F 5 yr. Cert. 6/ 2009 HazMat [Z|

Fire Permits 811031 HIGH-PILED COMBUSTIBLE STOCK, 801031 HAZARDOUS MATERIALS - use, handling or storage,

An inspection at the above location/occupany revealed the following violations(s) :

ASSEMBLY OCCUPANCIES

[ ] Post maximum occupancy load sign (CFC 1004.3)

|:|7 Remove combustible decorative material (CFC 807.1.2)
I:] Remove storage under stairway (CFC 315.3.2)

SIGNS

D Provide address visible from the street (CFC 505.1)

D Provide hazardous materials warning signs (CFC 2703.5)
EXITS

L__'I Provide/maintain approved panic hardware (CFC 1008.1.10)
I:l Remove locks, chains,bolts or bars from exit door (CFC 1008.1.9)
[] Remove exit obstruction (CFC 1003.6)

D Provide/maintain illuminated exit sign(s) (CFC 1011.1)
ACCESS

[ ] Provide outside Knox Box (CFC 506.1)

D Remove obstructions to fire apparatus access (CFC 503.4)
FIRE PROTECTION EQUIPMENT AND SYSTEMS

|____| Provide __2A10BC __40BC __ K (CFC 906.1)
D» Service and tag extinguisher(s) (CFC 901.6)

_extinguishers

D Hang extinguisher(s) 3.5-5' from floor (CFC 906.9)

[:I Clean filters, ducts , hood above cooking surface (CFC 904.1)

D Service au.to-extinguishing system semi-annually (CFC 904.11.6.2)
D' 5 yr certification on sprinkler/standpipe system (Title 19, Sect. 904)
MISCELLANEOUS

L__I Lower storage D 18" below sprinklers or l:l 2' from ceiling (CFC 315. 3 1)

~ (
D Secure compressed gas cylinders (CFC 5303.5. 3) 75 . ° \‘

D Post I:] Business License DFire Departme(vt”ﬁmmrt (CFC 705.3. 5) i

ﬁ!Sﬂn A m
. . ?{ ¥ 'I/ !
DNO VIOLATIONS Sen i g ) g 1 m‘,cg

ADDITIONAL VIOLATIONS AND/OR NOTES ~/-fram, / i gm

T - ") C?()

(/1 .« .?’f.— A{fz@{‘
ELECTRICAL SAFETY PRE-CAUTIONS 1 ©~

. Discontinue use of extension cords (CFC 605.5) | Lft”x%ﬂ
l:l Keep 30" clear for access in front of electrical panel i2
(CFC 605.3) .

D Provide/replace electrical DCover D SockeD Power Strip
(CFC 605.1)

HAZ-MAT SAFETY PRE-CAUTIONS

Provide approved cabinet if more than 10 gal.
I:' flammable liquids (CFC 5704.3.4.4)

D Provide approved safety container(s) for flammable
—————— liguids (CFC 5704.3.1)

HAZARDOUS MATERIALS DISCLosuRE

"(HSC CHAPTER 6. 95 Sectlon 25404 25500 25520)

Fallure to lmplementand/or electromcally submit a HMBP

v’\'\r Me/iv [

I:I Chemlcal inven ory |s mcomplete and/or requrres updatmg

E] ‘Site Map is mcomplete or msufﬂcrent

fl:l

The Emergency Response Plan is madequate and/or :
‘does not adequately address Notification, Mrtlgatlon s
Evacuatlon and/or Employee Tralnlng . -

‘Failure to report a change in: busmess or chemrcal
inventory within 30 days of the followmg :

D1oo% or: more mcrease m the quantlty of a drsclosed matenal
D Addmon of a prevrously undlsclosed matenal
- I:I Change of busmess name and owner
Falure to report a release or threatened release E '
I:I Farlure to submrt annual cemﬂcatlon o

@MINOR VIOLATION .

I:INO VIOLATIONS
fcj{‘;’ L \)

?f?d < "*’M A‘Q’MDCLASSIVIOLATION
WiTEC %0:’)4), 5{55,;(4@”‘ £ e

P

4]

Sl d,

[JcLass IVIOLATION

Lo, O /i

IV SIT 15/

BUE

A R,,ﬂ’%n(}r - Z«f?j r”jf SA TTOD e
R Arses BETWzn, 0T 4 Ei Uz//?”fﬁﬁ« )"/MKP MATCA) U\)NP}’ ThsY
Business representative signature '~""// f&,’) Date O,» T l 2~ [ <I~
Inspector Name/ ID # T 1s0 ] Ne SN~ Date_ /x b }Fi ‘"’! \

[@]Cleared I{ /5 _ /__Ll_/_\_ D Mailback card due __ / /[

[@]Re-inspection date_9 / 2.kt [ 12 [_Final Notice ___ /1




RDEN GROVE FIRE DEPARTMENT

11301 Acacia Parkway, P.'O. Box 3070
Garden Grove, CA 92842 (714) 741-5600

FINAL NOTICE

AND ORDER OF THE FIRE CHIEF
pate G /il /14
Address of violation(s): 1274 =~ Mon cveh 4 Insp. No &S5Y0
Occupant or DBA: R jlefer Beb’tﬁ;fag,zs LLC

Business Owner Information: Building Owner Information:
Owner: R iupnés Beveraess [ ¢ Owner: r;”
Address: 12740 Jonerch 81 Address: ’j’;

City: Govelzry  (oyoy= City: /S

Phone: ((U) 89S ~S169 zip: 92%y]  Phone: /| Zip:

A fire safety inspection at the above-named occupancy revealed violation(s) of the California
Fire Code. You were provided written notification of the violation(s) and a reinspection was

scheduled for _ R/t . G/ /v
Y 2NN A By A A

Upon reinspection, the following violation(s) was/were found to be uncorrected:
= Ho¢  Ch, €8S Scc, 2S5Yod, 25500-2552D
Fallere  to  Sebmit HMBP
DGCenTing ' WSE OF ExTenfian CotN € CEL - @65 §

s : ) )
f'\juxla,,\(—’. B HFT Asis SpAce [ision.  Acch@ss TS Eu;_i)u/b_/

Pursuant to Section 110.4 of the 2013 California Fire Code as adopted by Section 18.04.010
of the Garden Grove Municipal Code, you are hereby ordered to make all corrections as

listed,.

A FTNAI rainenactinn will ha made on f‘_}“’j/ff‘, , 204, Failure to cbmply with
EPA‘ H above constitutes a criminal offense and may subject the

“administrative fines in an amount up to $1,000 per violation
L,,.m—"i'/ 4,;5@@5/ 1s as available.,
- ’ A g : Z"%}K ) / \/(f; () Tjé/é?/‘-/

5{%{} JEee] PPTE Inspector
Bos opannaton Sufa— in:

Date:

ued on




GARDEN GROVE FIRE DEPARTMENT File # 6540

Life Safety & Hazardous Materials Disclosure Program Fire District 2414
11301 Acacia Parkway, Garden Grove, CA 92842 Inspector FPB DN Shift N
Bus 714-741-5600 Fax 714-741-5640 i NextInsp 2 2014
Occupant or DBA RIVERA BEVERAGES LLC Business Tel 714 895-5169
Address 12782 MONARCH St Suite Zip 92841
Business Owner KE‘V‘NGLARK ( \\,(\IC-QU Q\m?; CO el -5 - &QD léiTel 714 895-5169
Emergency Contact ’V ‘C\ \f\( \(B(U / \tf‘\\ \\(JV\ :ti 2 Tel _‘\L{"éﬂz; ’52&&(
Group S1 Load Sprinklers F/P/N F 5yr. Cert. 6 / 2009 Haz Mat [F}

Fire Permits 811031 HIGH-PILED COMBUSTIBLE STOCK, 801031 HAZARDOUS MATERIALS - use, handling or storage,

An inspection at the above location/occupany revealed the following violations(s) : 2 o 6/5,’%6(“’": 3
ASSEMBLY OCCUPANCIES ELECTRICAL SAFETY PRE-CAUTIONS C’(’i % v
D Post maximum occupancy load sign (CFC 1004.3) . |6] Discontinue use of extension cords (CFC 605.5) T4 2

[—_—l Remove combustible decorative material (CFC 807.1.2) D Keep 30" clear for access in-front of electrical panel 20 it
D Remove storage under stairway (CFC 315.3.2) (CFC 605.3) I
SIGNS ' DProvide/replace electrical [;]Coverl:] Socketi___l‘ Power Strip

[_] Provide address visible from the street (CFC 505.1) (CFC 605.1)

Q Provide hazardous materials warning signs (CFC 2703.5) HAZ-MAT SAFETY PRE-CAUTIONS
EXITS D Provide approved cabinet if more than 10 gal.
flammable liquids (CFC 5704.3.4.4)

[ ] Provide/maintain approved panic hardware (CFC 1008.1.10)

D Provide approved safety container(s) for flammable
[[] Remove locks, chains,bolts or bars from exit door (CFC 1008.1.9)

= quuids (CFC 5704.3, 1)

[] Provide/maintain illuminated exit sign(s) (CFC 1011.1) (HSC CHAPTER 6.95 Section 25404 25500 - 25520)
ACCESS Farlure to rmplement and/or electromcally submit a HMBP. -
[ ] Provide outside Knox Box (CFC 506.1) j : ;
I:] Remove obstructions to fire apparatus access (CFC 503.4) D Chemical inventory is incomplete and/or requires updating -
FIRE PROTECTION EQUIPMENT AND SYSTEMS : The Emergeney Response Pla‘n rs inadequate | and/or
I Provide __extinguishers __2A10BC _40BC K (GFC 906.1) - ‘E’?,Zifaﬂfoidjﬂgfgf'érﬁgfgfjj Rolficaton, Millgation,
:_[Service and tag extinguisher(s) (CFC 901.6) l:l Site Map is incomplete or rnsuﬁrcrent : o
:l' Hang extinguisher(s) 3.5'-5' from floor (CFC 906.9) D Failure to report a change in busrness or chemical = .
' mventory within 30 days of the followmg %
::I Clean filters, ducts , hood above cooking surface (CFC 904.1) |
- . [:I 100% or- more increase in the quantrty ofa drsclosed materral
:]’ Service auto-extinguishing system semi-annually (CFC 904.11 .6.2) U I:I Addition of 2 prewously un disclose d mate”a’
:l 5 yr certification on sprinkler/standpipe system (Title 19, Sect. 904) . D Change of busmess name. and owner
MISCELLANEOUS D Falure to report a release or threatened release
:I Lower storage E] 18" below. sprinklers or I:I 2' from ceiling (CFC 315. 3, 1) D Farlure to submrt annual certrflcatron
o / \ -_; : L 7
:] Secure compressed gas cylinders (CFC 5303.5.3) oy cj e ‘,1\ DNO VIOLATIONS . @ MINOR VIOLATION

:' Post D Business Llcense DFrre Department’permrt (CFCT0535.5) - ’L(?C} , {’éﬁl LV V\/\ ,:I CLASS 1 VlOLATlON "

o /"J@AQ e iq, i . . ,
_INOVIOLATIONS P AS G 7 by Farey, [ ko0 T : A‘Q"(ﬁ[]cmssrvror_mron
oo il i\t e = VITEC 3008 HS o p :
ADDITIONAL VIOLATIONS AND/OR NOTES /21547, [fgarl = " JA~

A ?\&F’WOU(‘T Lr:r?« AT IS TO0 b S AN :i’j?'_! j/)//)r/ ’{r;"fi [
M Arces /fﬁfff[/\/?-'ﬁ»gfgf ey T 3 RPViH
usiness representative signature / (3:/" Date ’ ‘ ~ [ %
Inspector Name/ 1D # ’?i'/ﬁ«"’?é’,] i\lr ,x\r"f?”‘/\/ Date_ Y /r G I 1”1 \

[’
Cleared __ /1 . L___l Mailback card due . ____ [#]Re-inspection date_ DANN: q l (fZ [ ]Final Notrce /_/




GARDEN GROVE FIRE DEPARTMENT

11301 Acacia Parkway, P."O. Box 3070
Garden Grove, CA 92842 (714) 741-5600

FINAL NOTICE

. AND ORDER OF THE FIRE CHIEF

pate G /il /{4

Address of violation(s): 12742 Moneweh 3t Insp. No &£S540
Occupant or DBA: Rivefee  bPeve g es LLC

Business Owner Information: Building Owner Information:

owner: v e BEvehaess, [ LL  Owner: rf/

Address: 12 740 Llonewvch $1 Address: _7_;*’*

City: Goyehen  Cyov= City: ./F;

Phone: (Z(U) 89S ~5169 zip: 925yl  Phone: / | Zip:

A fire safety inspection at the above-named occupancy revealed violation(s) of the California
Fire Code. You were provided written notification of the violation(s) and a reinspection was

scheduled for ?/h /M y ﬁ/llfl‘»] . Foreew va an 9/ *57/'? 5/
Upon remspection, the fo!lowmg v10lation(s) was/were found to be uncorrected:
— HS¢  Ch, €3S Scc, 2SUo4, 2550025520
F&;(lclrz, a0 waVV\i’jL “Mﬁp

TDClea T E ST OF ExTEefiian Catn s (R - GaS T

e R,
- P(Ln\li As A HUET Accl@ss  TNS BUWDW\O'/

Pursuant to Section 110.4 of the 2013 California Fire Code as adopted by Section 18.04.010
of the Garden Grove Municipal Code, you are hereby ordered to make all corrections as

listed.

Aisis OpAcE [Lspn.

A FINAL reinspection will be made on f/ Zf\ . 20 ¢, Failure to comply with
all items of this order listed above constitutes a crlmmal offense and may subject the
violator to criminal prosecution, administrative fines in an amount up to $1,000 per violation

and/or other enforcement actions as available.

L9 Neprgr
Inspector
Condition upon Final reinspection:
"’/“Ziuh
¥
Crapdif\
Inspector Signature: ezl Date: /{l/i//é'/

[] Administrative Citation igéued on
F5-4300.1 (12/13)




GARDEN GROVE FIRE DEPARTMENT File# 6540
Life Safety & Hazardous Materials Disclosure Program Fire District 2414
11301 Acacia Parkway, Garden Grove, CA 92842 Inspector FPB DN Shift N
Bus 714-741-5600 Fax 714-741-5640 Nextnsp 2 2014
Occupant or DBA RIVERA BEVERAGES LLC Business Tel 714 895-5169
‘Address 12782 MONARCH St Suite Zip 92841
714 8955169

Business Owner KE‘WN"@:—ARK §9) \\i\;(_,(k@ C)\f("\Z, O el - é»%(f) Zx@

Toanc(O - ApAlen 2

Te' T\% ole 522

Emergency Contact

Group S1 Sprinklers F/P/N

Load

F 5 yr. Cert. 6/ 2009 HazMat o

Fire Permits 11031 HIGH-PILED COMBUSTIBLE STOGK, 801031 HAZARDOUS MATERIALS - use, handling or storage,

An inspection at the above location/occupany revealed the following violations(s) :

ASSEMBLY OCCUPANCIES

D' Post maximum occupancy load sign (CFC 1004.3)

[:| Remove combustible decorative material (CFC 807.1.2)
[:] Remove storage under stairway (CFC 315.3.2)

SIGNS
[] Provide address visible from the street (CFC 505.1)

[:_1 Provide hazardous materials warning signs (CFC 2703.5)

EXITS

L—_] Provide/maintain approved panic hardware (CFC 1008.1.10)

D Remove locks, chains,bolts or bars from exit door (CFC 1008.1.9)
D Remove exit obstruction (CFC 1003.6)

D Provide/maintain illuminated exit sign(s) (CFC 1011.1)

ACCESS

[:l Provide outside Knox Box (CFC 506.1)
L___[ Remove obstructions to fire apparatus access (CFC 503.4)

FIRE PROTECTION EQUIPMENT AND SYSTEMS

E] Provide ___ektinguishers __2A10BC __40BC __ K (CFC 906.1)
D Service and tag extinguisher(s) (CFC 901.6)

D’ Hang extinguisher(s) 3.5'-5' from floor (CFC 906.9)

D Clean filters, ducts , hood above cooking surface (CFC 904.1)

D,' Service anto-extinguishing system semi-annually (CFC 904.11.6.2)
D 5 yr certification on sprinkler/standpipe system (Title 19, Sect. 904)

MISCELLANEOUS
[ Lower storage [ ] 18" below.sprinklers or [_] 2" from ceiling (CFC 315. 311)
]:] Secure compressed gas cylinders (CFC 5303.5.3) 57 59 % U

l:l Post I:] Business chense DFH’G Department &tmit (CFC 105.3. 5)

7{r By ;\Pﬂﬁpr FAT

'NO VIOLATIONS 577
| ATl 51_\:'\ Jng VB[ k12 Heldty.

ADDITIONAL VIOLATIONS AND/OR NOTES ~A-£r, / [ A }t '

’D

R & (7()

( ( ll O /ffwg)PMrJ
ELECTRICAL SAFETY PRE-CAUTIONS 4
[8] Discontinue use of extension cords (CFC 605. 5) T4 "’{v’%‘Z)\

[] Keep 30" clear for access in-front of electrical panel @, ..., in,
(CFC 605.3) .

D‘Provide/replace electrical ,;ICover [:] SockeD‘ Power Strip
(CFC 605.1)
HAZ-MAT SAFETY PRE-CAUTIONS

Provide approved cabinet if more than 10 gal.
Di flammable liquids (CFC 5704.3.4.4)

HAZARDOUS MATERIALS DlSCLOSURE

(HSC CHAPTER 6 95 Sectlon 25404 25500 25520)
l_—é—! Fallure to lmplement and/or electromcally submit a HMBP o
{,;; WWw. esubmrt ocgov co !

’V\«\rNaA/
“'«-ns_

D Chemical i inventory is mcomplete and/or requires. updatlng

Provide approved safety container(s) for flammable
liquids (CFC 5704.3.1)

‘The Emergency Response Plan is rnadequate and/or
D ‘does not adequately address Notification, Mmgatlon,
Evacuation and/or Employee Training. .

D Site Map.is mcomplete or insufficient

Failure to report a change in busmess or chemrcal - ;
mventory wrthm 30 days of the following » : 2

D100% or more. increase rn the guantity. of a dlsclosed matenal !

D Addition of a prevrously undlsclosed matenal k - ,

o D Change of busmess name and owner k ‘ o
E] Falure to report a release or threatened release

D Farlure to submlt annual certrﬂcatron - - - k s

DNO V'OLAT'ONS @ MINOR VlOLATION .

4 L u :
CLASS II VIOLATION 7

fud Tt AQ"‘(A CLASSIVIOLATION -
Ve Yoos b’/)j‘fﬂuy ,

dv ST 1)/§//£/\

F REMOUEG Lo ST ,m/ TS b 5 A ir’:lj, “‘/ '//i fomme
M Arces Eﬁfﬁuz?-zﬁ, 26T 4 RyViftA nl MAEP - mMATe{) w#{wfr H\lﬂf s
Busrness representative signature ‘ff/ K’) Date Of’— 2~ [ <1L
Inspector Name/ ID # R0 i\lcgﬂn)\i”fc%*./\/ Date_ 4 / r"?/, t‘“? '

[7lCleared Il 15 / I(/\ ™1 Mailhark card die i /

[A1Ra-insnection date % / i [{ [ 1Final Nnhce

/]




GARDEN GROVE

FIRE DEPARTMENT

HAZARDOUS MATERIALS
DISCLOSURE PROGRAM

REPORTING FORMS PACKET
SHORT VERSION

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY
FACILITY ID NO. 20023
BUSINESS NAME izm eva M’nﬁ;@}s L(C,
BUSINESS ADDRESS | Q1R M@ww&\'\ Gjr
APPROVED BY (7., DATE "ZJ 20| |

NEW BUSINESS _ (I YES (INO  UPDATE

PICK 4D __ BUSLIST _ CALARP: __CUPA:  GIS .

FEE

Revised 2/2007




FIRE SAFETY SURVEY Eile # 6540
GARDEN GROVE FIRE DEPARTMENT Fire District 2414

. = & Inspector FPB  Shift N
11301 Acacia Parkway, Garden Grove, CA 92842 Q, B Next Insp 3 12011
Bus 714-741- 5600 , Fax 714-741-5640 FYTHE G20 30‘\, NERrYEY

Occupant or DBA RivERA BEVERAGES LLC ** wada;qu Geveppcks Li.c  Business Phone i/ gos (g

Address 12782 MONARCH St Sutte o —
Phone ggj <5y, gu34

Phone 71y Gzf 3021

Business Owner  [£yrn (LAZK

Emergency Contact NEVE Duare

Group S1 Load Sprinklers F/P/N F 5yr. Cert. 06/01/2009 Haz Mat
Fire Permits . :
e TOED sTeRAcE G4

o oy N 4
(?3 17 {/

- FRATS N 22 IJ/ Peotan ’/ FLAVORES 65 CFAk W’ir"’ﬁ“ﬁ) P /Z, o

An inspection at the above location/occupany revealed the following violations(s)
SIGNS ASSEMBLY OCCUPANCIES

D Provide address visible from the street (CFC 505.1) D Post maximum occupancy load sign (CFC 1004.3)

[] Provide hazardous materials warning signs (CFC 2703.5) [] Remove combustible decorative material (CFC 807.1.2)
EXITS D Remove storage under stairway (CFC 315.2.2)

O Provide/maintain approved panic hardware (CFC 1008.1.9) ELECTRICAL SAFETY PRE-CAUTION:

[] Remove locks, chains,bolts or bars from exit door (CFC 1008.1.8) 7] Discontinue use of extension cords (CFC 605.6)
: Keep 30" clear for access in front of electrical panel

D Remove exit door/hardware (CFC 1008.1.8.5) ~ (CFC 605.3)
Location - i ; I:]Provide/replace electrical __cover __socket __power sirip
[] Remove exit obstruction (CFC 1028.3) : ™ (CFC 605.1)
[ ] Provide/maintain ifluminated exit sign(s) (CFC 1011.2) Location
» Provide and maintain approvéd emergency lighting (CFC 1006.1) HAZ-MAT SAFETY PRE-CAUTIONS
ACCESS Complete Hazardous Materials Disclosure packet
714-741-5636 (CFC 2701.5.1)

[ ] Provide outside Knox Box (CFC 506.1)

[:]_'Remove obstructions fo fire apparatus access (CFC 503.4) [ ] Provide approved cabinet if more than 10 gal. flammable

liquids (CFC 3404.3.4.3)

FIRE PROTECTION EQUIP. AND SYS. D Provide approved safety containers(s) for flammable
[ Provide __extinguishers __2A10BC __40BC __K (CFC 906.1) - liquids (CFC 3404.3.1)

Service and tag extinguisher(s) (CFC 901.6) MISCELLANEOUS
D Lower storage ___18" below sprinklers or ___2' from ceiling

@Hang extinguisher(s) 3.5-5' from floor (Title 19, Sec.567.6) (CFC 315.2.1)
[%%] Secure coglpress?d gas cylinders (CFC 3003.5.3)

[:] Clean filters, ducts , hood above cooking surface (CFC 904.11.6.4)
D Post__ Business License __Fire Department Permit

D Service auto-extinguishing system semi-annuaily (CFC 904.11.6.3) (CFC 705.6)

r_—] 5 yr certification on sprinkler/standpipe system (Title 19, Sect. 904) > REGALR o€ BN MIX G-

ADDITIONAL VIOLATIONS AND/OR NOTES [INO VIOLATIONS ooy - gramm asyisy ook
TV PERING B,

- PEMTTE PEscalt ErLE st AND REMWE MZZns To  Sholl DIRFIYng af  ExEi
» PLACE  siLesbfr g Dooiz To LNDSATE WA 24y LEVEL,

B CovTANED

‘LABEL Dop nhipE RELEZ L5 LocaTED
* EPMAMGLE L LouD s CARINES PEQuIRED P PnvsZigs = Akl FLApmplil L9eS5 Hug O

TN APPRoVED - CantninEls. K BRog FLeMumngs Lipucds T (Coup L€Vl
Business representative signature _x B~ (;\A- fMade— Date | —14 "'”
Inspector ID# __ neg (3. HACEL [/ D . NenYEd Date m/m/u
7

ClearedZL/i //Z D Mailback carddue __/ / Re-inspection date 02/ ¢ / Z5il [:] Final Notice __ / __ /
| Sopfa il




City OF GARDEN GROVE FIRE DEPARTVMENT
113017 Acacia Parkway, Garden Grove, CA 92842 (714) 741-5600 (714) 741-5636

Hazardous Materials Business Information Form

Page ___ of ___. 3

BUSINESS INFORMATION

..,| BEGINNING DATE

ENDING DATE .
[2-%1-1

4 | BUSINESS PHONE

BUSINESS NAME = e
R\Ul@ﬁ‘&%@(&"ﬁﬁﬁ% LLC NMH-F945 -5 1439

(Supphed by.GGFD) ot

BUSINESS SITE ADDRESS
[LTE2 Movtawz,l/\ o
7 STATE 8 | ZIP 9
o GARDEN GROVE CA C] 2541
DUN & BRADSTREET 10 | SIC CODE (4 DIGIT &) 11 | FIRE DISTRICT 12
13

COUNTY
ORANGE

BUSINESS OPERATOR NAME

14 OPE@TOR 'S PHONE

(- 55 B4

\ Vv C{&rL 7
BUSINESS OWNER

OWNER NAME ] OWNER PHONE ___ 1
Ltguidiby L Le %45 - S

OWNER MAILING ADDRESS U K ~ 18

cIry 19 ZIP 21

ENVIRONMENTAL CONTACT
CONTACT NAME 22 CONTACT PHONE 2
lovu Autlau , Ti4-%G5~ 5169
24

JONTACT MAILING ADDRESS |

' .
cIry i 25 zZip 27

PRIMARY EMERGENCY CONTACTS | SECONDARY

" Ty Aukilen " Witbeds Otozeo
™ Pland Supeciiisar I Sales Ma\/\ﬂélé\f

BUSINESS PHONE /[l"t.’ ﬁ@/‘s’/{/ 5l(p(2, 30 | BUSINESS PHONE /l “,(:/ %C]‘;,gl(oc?

24-HR. PHONE ‘7%{_9@(2“ ?ZZLJ -HR, @6@ _ 23'0‘43106]

32 | PAGER#

PAGER #

ADDITIONAL LOCALLY COLLECTED INFORMATION

DESCRIBE THE TYPE OF BUSINESS OPERATIO %@—%‘{'(eé L\ 0:”(9{ Ma WA_«Q].L‘}U,U‘{\D[&

BILLING ADDRESS (IF DIFFERENT FROM ABOVE)

38 | TOTAL # OF EMPLOYEES " 39

40 | ATTENTION 41

PROPERTY OWNER NAME ADDRESS | BI85 S, (Sigueina Sk, [ L¢3 | PHONE

RP-2 Mav\&a‘LlA ch IS Qu\\ tatecle Cqimup - Lns% lec, <o el | Z1%-37-95(3
Certlﬁcatlon Based on my mqunnf of those individuals respons:gle for obtaining the mformatlon | certify under penalty of law that 1
have personally examined and am familiar with the information submitted and believe the information is true, accurate, and complete.

SIGNATURE OF OWNER/OPI-TATQB OR DESIG%\TED REPRESENTATIVE 45 | DATE l g 46
. A\
"’\ME OF SIGNER (print) 47 | NAME OF DOCUMENT ARER (p 49
K&U?m W\ / C/l ol R@Ux VL b{'/ CL[M’@—— ,
TITLE OF SIGNER \ : 48 | TITLE OF DOCUMENT PREPARER 50
N AN Mumalp s

Business info Form 1 — 03/06/03




CITY OF GARDEN GROVE FACILITY INFORMATIO!
11301 ACACIA PARKWAY C UP A

GARDEN GROVE, CALIFORNIA 92842
BUSINESS ACTIVITIES

(714) 741-5636

:_FACILITY. IDENTIFICATION. |
1.} EPAID # (Hazardo

 Waste Only) 2

PR

BUSINESS NAME (Same as FACILITY NAME or.DBA-Doing Business As)

/7 ~
Cwiera Papfayes . LLC, —

If Yes, please complete these pages of the UPCF....

A. HAZARDOUS MATERIALS =
Have on site (for any purpose) hazardous materials at or above 55 "’Q/YE\,S [jNno 4
gallons for liquids, 500 pounds for solids, or 200 cubic feet f(f:r”
compressed gases (include liquids in ASTs and USTs), or the
applicable Federal threshold quantity for an extremely hazardous .
substance specified-in 40 CFR Part 355, Appendix A or B; or handle
radiological materials in quantities for which an emergency plan is
required pursuant to 10 CFR Parts 30, 40 or 707

- UNDERGROUND STORAGE TANKS (USTs)

Own or operate underground storage tanks?

+ HAZARDOUS MATERIALS INVENTORY -
CHEMICAL DESCRIPTION (Form 3)

e

o]

[1ves [Q NO 5.1/ USTFACILITY (Formerly SWRCB Form A)

" UST TANK (one page per tank) (Formerly Form B)

6.1 USTFACILITY

v UST TANK (one per tank)

v UST INSTALLATION - CERTIFICATE OF
COMPLIANCE (one page per tank} (Formerly

Form C)
NLe) 7. | ¥ UST TANK (closure portion-one page per tank)

-
h

2. Intent'to upgrade existing or install new USTs? []YEs ﬁ;{ NO

. _Need to report closing a UST? {1YES
. ABOVE GROUND PETROLEUM STORAGE TANKS {ASTs)
Own or operate ASTs above these thresholds:
- any tank capacity is greater than 660 gallons, or
- the total aggregate capacity for the entire facility (ASTs, drums and
portable containers) greater than 1,320 gallons?

. HAZARDOUS WASTE
[I1YES RINO 9.} EPAID NUMBER -provide at the top of this page

Generate hazardous waste?
2. Recycle more than 100 kg/month of excluded or exempted recyclable |[] YES NO 10 | / RECYCLABLE MATERIALS REPORT
{one per recycler)

materials (per HSC §25143.2)7

[

[1ves m'NO 8.1 v NO FORM REQUIRED TO CUPAS

o

-4

[Jyes @'NO 11. 1 " ONSITE HAZARDOUS WASTE
TREATMENT - FACILITY

(Formerly DTSC Fomns 1772)

+ ONSITE HAZARDOUS WASTE
TREATMENT - UNIT (one page per unit)
(Formerly DTSC Forms 1772A8,C,0 and L)

S{NO 12. 1 /' CERTIFICATION OF FINANCIAL

ASSURANCE (Formery DTSC Form 1232)

[B(NO 13. | /' .REMOTE WASTE/CONSOLIDATION SHE

ANNUAL NOTIFICATION (Fosmery DTSC

Form 1196)

14. 1 ¥ HAZARDOUS WASTE TANK CLOSURE
CERTIFICATION (Formerly DTSC Form 1249) -

3. Treat hazardous waste on site?

4. Treatment subject to financial assurance requirements (for Permit by |[]YES
Rule and Condition Authorization)?
S.  Consolidate hazardous waste generated at a remove site? [ ves

6. Need to report the closure/removal of a tank that was classified [Jves E})&O
waste and cleaned onsite?

E. LOCAL REQUIREMENTS

E;yﬂo 15. | ' REGULATED SUBSTANCE REPORTING

Cal-ARP: California Accidental Release Prevention Program [Myes
FORM (Orange County CUPA)

" SC Chapter 6.95, Article 2, §25531 et seq
Stationary Source with more than a Threshold Quantity of a Regulated
Substance in a Process




GARDEN GROVE FIRE DEPARTMENT
HAZARDOUS MATERIALS DISCLOSURE PROGRAM

BUSINESS EMERGENCY PLAN

Personnel Emergency Notifications and Responsibilities

Employee Evacuation and Staging Areas:

1. The type of alarm signal that will be used to initiate an evacuation at the
facility (vocal, paging system, manual alarm, etc.).

Vocal /&
2. All employees shall be trained to evacuate the facility through at least one exit.
Alternate exit routes shall be designated if available. 1 vt D 8o [
Mandoogs Preductrop Meas
3. Staging areas shall be designated for all employees. Staging areas will be the
location that all employees shall report to in the event of an emergency. ,
a4 port D Lacqe & % Bl Lot Foe
One person shall be designated to account for all personnel at the stagin %J‘l&ib@]

g
area. That person will be responsible for meeting the incoming Fire units and
reporting the conditions known about the incident. /TOVU,‘ A(Vcl'\\b\v\/k

o

The Staging area is at the following location as shown on your site plan map:
£ . 1

L‘N\C\.@ M \DO/\)”\L\\'\Q\ Lot @l o ?)LC\\Amz} ’

Employee Responsibilities:

At least one employee shall be responsible for the following minimum requirements
in the event of an emergency response by the Fire Department.
‘A(V\:RC\%\,

| N | Towy
Notify employees. Initiate evacuation procedures.

Notify the Garden Grove Fire Department. Dial 911,

Try to identify the nature of the incident.

Report to the staging area and account for evacuated employees.

Report to the incoming fire units.

S

Activate any emergency mitigation procedures that area available at your
business. (List below any mitigation procedures specific to your business, if

any.)

Use qualabe  Twe Bybnsushie s

Page 21




GARDEN GROVE FIRE DEPARTMENT
HAZARDOUS MATERIALS DISCLOSURE PROGRAM

BUSINESS EMERGENCY PLAN

Personnel Emergency Notifications and Responsibilities (Continued)

Training Requirements

State law requires training of employees where the business uses, handles or stores
hazardous materials.

Employee training provided on:

- Appointment of person/persons on site who are trained in key role positions.
Emergency coordinator, evacuation coordinators, staging area supervisors and
documenting officers.

o Procedures to follow during a release or threatened release of a hazardous
material (evacuation to staging areas).

« Information contained in material safety data sheets.

« Warning labels/placards. '

- Safe work practices.

- Use of on-site emergency equipment and supplies.

« Use and location of personal protective equipment.

» Any chemical, hazardous material or substance that could be encountered in

his/her work area.
+ On site alarm system for evacuation.
 Discuss possible release of hazardous materials scenario.

Emergency Notifications

A handler of hazardous materials is required to immediately report any release or
threatened release of hazardous materials to the Garden Grove Fire Department.
Failure to do so may result in criminal and/or civil prosecution.

Required Notifications

In the event of a release or threatened release of hazardous materials, it is State
law to notify each of the following agencies.

Agency Phone Numbers

Garden Grove Fire Department, Police, Paramedics 911

Office of Emergency Services (OES) (800) 852-7550 or
(916) 427-4341

National Response Center (800) 424-8802

Page 22




GARDEN GROVE FIRE DEPARTMENT
HAZARDOUS MATERIALS DISCLOSURE PROGRAM

BUSINESS EMERGENCY PLAN

Personnel Emergency Notifications and Responsibilities (Continued)

Prevention

All materials are stored, used and handled within the guidelines of the Uniform Fire
Code, N.F.P.A. standards, California Administrative Code, Titles 19 and 20.

This section is meant to initiate a Prevention Plan at your business and to assist in
preventing a release, or threatened release, of a hazardous material. In the spaces
provided, place a checkmark by the preventive actions which have been initiated by
your business to abate hazards relating to hazardous material handling, use of

storage.

Consideration shall include:

‘1. Drum storage and/or above ground tank storage areas:
./ a. Isolation and separation of incompatible materials.
b. Diking areas to contain spills.

c. Storage on paved ground.

K

2. Compressed and/or cryogenic gas storage areas:
V" a. Cylinder stored upright and secured.

M/’/{ b. Isolation and/or separation of incompatible cylinders (oxygen and
flammable gases, etc.).

3. General:
a. Safe work practices are exercised in daily routines.
1/b. Employees who handle hazardous materials are properly trained.

/c. Material Safety Data Sheets (MSDS) readily available for each
hazardous material on the premises.

x/d. Labeling of all materials and storage areas with the product name and
hazards associated with the product (drums, piping, tanks, etc.).

1/ €. Uniform Fire Code (UFC) requires separation between outside
hazardous material storage area or tanks and combustible materials

(wood, bush, etc.).
L f.  Posting of "No Smoking” signs where appropriate.

JO@ S@f\O\C\w\\S /-—)ELC\ (x _,\

Page 23




ay

&

GARDEN GROVE FIRE DEPARTMENT

BUSINESS EMERGENCY PLAN

A BUSINESS IS REQUIRED BY LAW TO NOTIFY THE GARDEN GROVE FIRE
DEPARTMENT WITHIN 30 DAYS OF ANY OF THE FOLLOWING EVENTS.

Change of business address. ]
Change of business ownership.

Change of business name.

Cessation of business operation (quitting business).

Use or handling of a previously undisclosed hazardous material.

A 100% increase in the quantity of a previously disclosed
L hazardous material.

Ut N

Your business is required by State law (CFC 8001.3.2) to retain a copy of this entire
Hazardous Materials Disclosure information, including the Business Plan, chemical
inventory, material safety data sheets and site maps, for review by Fire Department
personnel. State where your disclosure and Emergency Business Plan will be kept.

Otfrse Suonian Ol To  Cabonal

Show location on site map also using symbol in the legend.

Note: A fee js charged for a replacement copy from the Garden Grove Fire
Department.

I certify, under penalty of perjury, that the enclosed information is
true and correct to the best of my knowledge.

Signature: %

Name: /( V’)(\Y‘ ’AV\AYX\\(}V\

Title: 3\ 1(9 wl Managy

Date: _ ©OQ -0~ U -

HAZ BUS DISCL SHORT VER

Page 24




