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Vendor / Installer Coordination Matrix - Generator Package 
GREAT WOLF LODGE 

Attachment "C" 
 

Work Element 
L = Lead, A = Assist, F = Furnish, I = Install 

TCCo/TL Vendor Mech Elec BATC Other

Coordination 
Meetings 

Attend Coordination Meeting(s) L A A A A A 

TL provides TCCo super with Receipt Verification 
Form 

F      

Coordinate installation (including assembly, 
location and connections). 

 A A L A A 

Coordinate junction box size (and top or bottom 
feed) 

 A  L   

Coordinate cable schedule and lug requirements.  A  L   

TCCo to coordinate utility requirements/approval, 
where applicable. 

L A A A   

Submittal review - review approved vendor 
submittals, coordinate with installation, sign-off 
and provide comments and feedback. 

 A A L A A 

Obtain all required permits, including but not 
limited to building permits. 

A  A L   

Obtain required AQMD permit      L 
TCCo to obtain approval from Fire Marshall or 
AHJ prior to release for fabrication. 

L A A A  A 
 

Delivery 

TCCo to release vendor to fabricate and monitor 
delivery.   

L    
    

Vendor to provide written acknowledgement to 
TCCo & T=L confirming release of fabrication 
including delivery dates.   

 L   

    

Vendor to immediately notify TCCo & T=L if 
delivery date slips. 

 L   
    

Coordinate delivery (including delivery location 
(jobsite, rigger's yard), time, schedule, restrictions) 

L A A A 
    

Coordinate delivery from factory to jobsite/rigger's 
yard (including packaging, shipping splits) 

A L  A 
    

Coordinate delivery from rigger's yard to jobsite 
(including accepting and coordinating delivery at 
rigger's yard, receipt of equipment, tracking of 
equipment, offloading and rigging plan) 

A   L 

    

Identification on packaging: (shipping labels)  F  A     
Firmly attach label(s) to equipment indicating 
name of manufacturer, equipment model number, 
equipment serial number and tag number. 

 F & I   
  

Protection of equipment during shipment  L       
Upon delivery, inspection equipment and 
document on receipt verification form with TCCo.  

   L 
    

Protection of equipment after receipt    L     

Off-load, rig, final setting and care & custody.    L     

If unit needs to be broken down for shipment and 
reassembled 

 L  A 
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Work Element 
L = Lead, A = Assist, F = Furnish, I = Install 

TCCo /  
TL Vendor Mech Elec BATC Other 

Generator 
Package 

Provide technical support for a complete 
installation 

 A  L   

Meet all seismic  requirements for equipment only 
per drawing S1.1 

 F&I     

Meet all seismic  requirements for equipment 
installation per drawing S1.1 

   F&I   

Witness installation  A     

ALL mechanical/plumbing piping, connections, 
and associated hardware and accessories 

  F&I    

ALL Equipment power/ control/ communications 
connections, conduit and wiring 

   F&I   

Accessories (i.e.: terminal blocks, I/O cards, 
relays) 

 F&I  A   

Building controls and interface with equipment, 
including low voltage wiring 

    F&I  

Housekeeping pad and/or inertia base and submit 
to A/E for approval 

     F&I 

Anchor bolts and brackets for installation    F&I   

Vibration isolators, seismic restraints, seismic 
snubbers 

   F&I   

Generator mounted vibration isolators  F&I     

Provide Equipment required to meet current 
SCAQMD emissions standards 

 F&I     

Provide Equipment  required to meet current IBC 
seismic standards 

 F&I     

For retrofit applications, verify compatibility of 
systems. 

 L  A   

For applications when paralleling new generators 
with existing generators, verify compatibility of the 
generators, including but not limited to the 
following items: voltage regulators, governors, 
alternators. 

 L  A   

Paralleling switchgear: Mounting hardware and 
accessories for disconnecting devices mounted in 
new switchgear line-up 

 F&I     

Paralleling switchgear: For retrofit applications: 
Mounting hardware for disconnecting devices to 
be mounted in existing switchgear line-up 

 F  I   

Generator CBs (unit mounted)  F&I     

Generator CBs (remote mounted)  F  I   

If unit mounted, batteries, battery charger(s), and 
battery heaters 

 F&I     

If remote mounted, batteries, battery charger(s), 
and battery heaters 

 F  I   
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Work Element 
L = Lead, A = Assist, F = Furnish, I = Install 

TCCo/TL Vendor Mech Elec BATC Other

Generator 
Package 

If unit mounted, generator control panel and 
control panel heater 

 F&I     

If remote mounted, generator control panel and 
control panel heater 

 F  I   

SCAQMD Permits L A     

IBC Certification for all equipment provided  F&L     

Generator Remote start/stop (if required)  F  I   

Generator Remote annunciator  F  I   

Generator Remote monitoring equipment  F  I   

Generator Modem  F  I   

If generator enclosure, provide and install 
louvers 

 F&I     

If generator enclosure, provide and install space 
heater 

 F&I     

If generator enclosure, provide and install 
raincaps and piping 

 F&I     

If generator enclosure, provide and install 
exhaust silencer/muffler, flex, and associated 
hardware 

 F&I     

If exhaust silencer/muffler, flex, and associated 
hardware are shipped separately 

 F I    

If generator enclosure, permanent load bank  F&I     

Day/ subbase tank (shipped with assembled 
unit) 

 F&I     

If day/ subbase tank is shipped separately due 
to size restraints 

 F I    

Remote fuel tank   F&I    

Remote Fuel Fill Station and piping   F&I    
Control wiring and power feeds to remote fuel 
tank 

   F&I   

Fuel flexes (for sub base tank only)  F I    

If unit mounted radiator  F&I     

Glycol  F&I     
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Work Element 
L = Lead, A = Assist, F = Furnish, I = Install 

TCCo/TL Vendor Mech Elec BATC Other 

Close-Out 

Installation inspection  L A A   

Pre-start-up checklist (to TCCo and installing 
contractors) 

 F&A A L A  

Submit Start-up/commissioning procedure for 
approval 

 F&L  A   

Start-up A L A A A  

Temporary load bank, cables and meters  F  I   

Coordination of load bank type and testing 
requirements 

 A  L  A 

Fuel for start-up    F   

Fuel fill for Owner turnover    F   

Pre-commissioning meeting L A A A A A 

Commissioning A A A L A L 

Coordination Study/Short Circuit Analysis A A  A  L 
Adjustment of equipment settings (i.e. CB trip 
settings) 

 L  A  A 

Field testing A L A A A  

Housekeeping, clean-up, touch-up paint  A A L A  

Owner training  L  A   

O&M manuals to TCCo  F     

Provide attic stock and spare parts as specified  F F F   

Parts warranty  F     

Equipment labor warranty  F     

Installation labor warranty   F F   

Trouble shooting during warranty period A L L L L L 

Building controls parts / labor warranty     F  

Temporary Use Maintenance    F&L   

Warranty certificates  F     
 

 


